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§ 40-2-39.1.  Restrictions on sale or advertising of used motor vehicles displayed or 
parked; exceptions; enforcement; penalty  
 
 
   (a) (1) An owner or lessee of any real property shall not authorize more than five 
used motor vehicles within any 12 month period displayed or parked on such real 
property for the purpose of selling or advertising the sale of such used motor 
vehicles by the owner or lessee of such vehicles. 
 
   (2) An owner or lessee of any real property shall not authorize more than two used 
motor vehicles at the same time displayed or parked on such real property for the 
purpose of selling or advertising the sale of such used motor vehicles by the owner 
or lessee of such vehicles. 
 
   (3) An owner or lessee of any used motor vehicle shall not display or park such 
used motor vehicle on the real property of another for the purpose of selling or 
advertising the sale of such used motor vehicle if the display or parking of such 
vehicle will cause the owner or lessee of the real property to be in violation of 
paragraph (1) or (2) of this subsection. 
 
   (4) An owner or lessee of any used motor vehicle shall not display or park such 
used motor vehicle on the real property of another for the purpose of selling or 
advertising the sale of such used motor vehicle unless the owner or lessee of such 
vehicle has the prior permission of the owner or lessee of the real property. 
 
(b) The provisions of subsection (a) of this Code section shall not apply: 
 
   (1) If the owner or lessee of the vehicle displayed or parked is employed by the 
owner or lessee of the real property on which the vehicle is displayed or parked; 
 
   (2) If the owner or lessee of the vehicle displayed or parked is conducting business 
with the owner or lessee of the real property on which the vehicle is parked or 
displayed at the time such vehicle is displayed or parked; or 
 
   (3) If the real property on which a vehicle is parked is a parking lot for which a fee 
is charged for the use of such parking lot, the owner or lessee of the parked vehicle 
has paid the fee for the use of such parking lot, and such vehicle is legitimately 



parked on the property for purposes other than displaying, selling, or advertising the 
sale of such vehicle. 
 
(c) (1) An owner or lessee of any real property shall not authorize any used motor 
vehicle to be displayed or parked on such real property for the purpose of selling or 
advertising the sale of such used motor vehicle if such vehicle is not lawfully titled 
and registered in the name of the individual or entity offering such vehicle for sale in 
accordance with the applicable provisions of this chapter and Chapter 3 of this title. 
 
   (2) A person shall not advertise, display, sell, or offer for sale any used motor 
vehicle unless such vehicle is lawfully titled and registered in such person's name in 
accordance with the applicable provisions of this chapter and Chapter 3 of this title. 
 
(d) Any law enforcement officer or agency, the board, or the owner or lessee of any 
real property upon which a vehicle is displayed or parked in violation of subsection 
(a) or (c) of this Code section for longer than 24 consecutive hours may have any 
such vehicle towed from such real property and stored at the expense of the owner 
or lessee of such vehicle and may then dispose of said vehicle in accordance with 
Chapter 11 of this title. 
 
(e) A violation of this Code section shall constitute an unfair or deceptive act or 
practice and shall be a violation of Part 2 of Article 15 of Chapter 1 of Title 10, the 
"Fair Business Practices Act of 1975." A violation of this Code section may be 
penalized as provided in Code Section 43-47-21 or any other applicable provision of 
this Code, including, but not limited to, the "Fair Business Practices Act of 1975." 
 
(f) This Code section shall not apply to any person licensed under Chapter 47 of Title 
43 or to any franchised motor vehicle dealer or any subsidiary wholly owned or 
controlled by such dealer. This Code section shall not eliminate or change the 
requirement for any person to obtain a license under Chapter 47 of Title 43 if such 
person engages in any conduct or activity for which a license is required under 
Chapter 47 of Title 43. 
 
(g) Any person who violates this Code section shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and, 
upon conviction thereof, shall be subject to a fine not to exceed $1,000.00 for each 
violation or imprisonment for a period not to exceed 12 months, or both. 
 
HISTORY: Code 1981, § 40-2-39.1, enacted by Ga. L. 2007, p. 214, § 2/HB 144.  
 
 
 
 
 


